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••• very suitable   •• suitable   • technically possible 

Assembly and construction 
adhesive

Polymers

H - polymer MS
H-polymer STP 
transparent

Hranipex 
application pistol

Technical information

Packing cartridges 290 ml; 
carton (15)

cartridges 290 ml; 
carton (15)

1 ks

Base hybrid polymer hybrid polymer ✕

Type of curing neutral alcoxy group neutral alcoxy group ✕

Processing time approx. 6 min approx. 6 min ✕

Curing time 2 - 3 mm / 24 h 2 - 3 mm / 24 h ✕

Application’s temperature from 5 to 35 °C from 5 to 35 °C ✕

Thermal resistance from -40 to +90 °C from -40 to +90 °C ✕

Application field
Suitable for bonding 
and sealing all building 
materials - stone, wood, 
concrete, metal, bricks, 
glass, ceramics, plaster, 
polyurethane, plastics, 
plywood, etc. It is also 
suitable for elastic joints 
in vibrating structures, for 
connection elements made 
of galvanized steel sheet, 
brass and other metals.

Suitable for bonding and 
sealing in interiors and 
exteriors, resistant to 
extreme weather conditions 
and UV radiation. Usable 
for most materials (mirrors, 
aluminium, polycarbonate, 
wood, plastics, building 
materials), water resistant, 
transparent.

High quality application 
pistols designed for long-
term application without 
effort (efficient gearing).
Also very suitable for 
application of H-silicones 
and H-polymers.

Assembly and construction 
adhesive

Silicones

H - silicone transparent H - silicone white H - silicone mirror

Technical information

Packing cartridges 310 ml; 
carton (15)

cartridges 310 ml; 
carton (15)

cartridges 310 ml; 
carton (15)

Base silicone silicone alcoxy silicone

Type of curing acetate acetate neutral alcoxy group

Processing time approx. 25 min approx. 25 min approx. 10 min

Curing time 2 mm / 24 h 
(relative humidity 55%)

2 mm / 24 h 
(relative humidity 55%)

2 mm / 24 h 
(relative humidity 55%)

Application’s temperature from 5 to 40 °C from 5 to 40 °C from 5 to 40 °C

Thermal resistance from -40 to +180 °C from -40 to +180 °C from -40 to +180 °C

Application field
Versatile use, suitable for 
glazing, sealing partition 
walls, window niches etc. 
Not suitable for bonding 
mirrors, aquariums 
and natural stone or 
unprotected metals.

Versatile use, suitable for 
glazing, sealing partition 
walls, window niches etc. 
Not suitable for bonding 
mirrors, aquariums 
and natural stone or 
unprotected metals.

Suitable for attaching 
decorative mirrors on 
different substrates such 
as glaze, glass, plaster, 
concrete, OSB board, 
wood, plywood, etc.
It is also useful for 
bonding mirror mosaics 
(mirror to mirror), mirrors 
in bathrooms and on 
substrates which may be 
subject to vibration and 
tension.
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